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A more active day on the derivative as rates slid across the 
board. An axe was taken to the prompt with Dec trading 
down to $32500 (-$5k) which implies balance of month 
24,446/day. The Jan, q1 and cal 22 were also whacked as 
good volume changed hands and some stop loss selling was 
clearly evident. The physical market was also under huge 
pressure as the Atlantic routes were slashed in a sea of red. 
With 11 sleeps until Christmas and only 8 index publications 
to go, where we go from here is anyone's guess but right 
now the sentiment is certainly negative. As we approach the 
new year with a heavily discounted q1 market and the 
seasonal weather disruptions,  it doesn't feel like this 
negativity  will turn around this side of Santa's visit.

Another day of losses on Panamax paper as the underlying 
struggles to find a foothold as the tonnage count mounts in 
both basins and the bearish cape sentiment further fuels 
sellers appetite. Dec broke $25k support to print $24750 
low while Jan bore the brunt on the prompts slipping from 
$22250 to $20500 and dragging from Q1 $22250 to $21000 
while further out Cal22 Pmx broke $20k support to trade 
down to $19850 and Cal23 traded $14000. With the curve 
holding some sharp discounts now all eyes remain fixed on 
the underlying for any respite. 
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