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An interesting day on the Cape size with some decent 
intraday volatility. The prompts saw considerable selling 
seeing May trading down from $20800 to $20250 and the 
June and July trading down over $800 each to print lows of 
$20250 and $20200 respectively, Q3 and Q4 followed suit 
giving up ave $1k and $500 respectively on the day as the 
contango continued to narrow. Further out the deferred 
came under pressure with the Cal24 trading at a low 15000 
before finding some support and ticking back up to $15200. 
We ticked up off the lows towards the close but on limited 
volume which was largely attributed to some profit taking 
rather than a turnaround.

With Capes under pressure and the physical struggling to 
find a foothold the sell off intensified today on Panamax 
paper triggering some long liquidations which saw rates 
gapping lower. Once the dust had settled May and June 
sold off to $11700 and $12400 lows respectively, Q3 broke 
$14k support to print $13800 in some size, Q4 traded down 
to $13350 and Cal24 saw $12k support tested. Some profit 
taking saw rates nudged back up off the lows but the 
overall tone remains cautious as we finished sharply lower 
on the day.
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