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Yet more pain in capes today with the relentless selling of 
the contango in Cape sept continuing today. Having been 
sold aggressively and in size from $13750 to $12750 
yesterday, the selling continued today with selling down 
from $12750 to a low of $11500 late in the afternoon 
session. Whilst Sept weathered most of the storm, the rest 
of the curve also came under pressure with Oct and Q4 sold 
$15250, Q1 size selling down from $8300 to $8100 and 
cal24 down to $13500 where it traded a number of times. 
The only solace was that the market closed with cheaper 
offers getting paid and closing off the lows. Have a great 
evening.

With the positive moment off the underlying running out of 
steam and the continued bearish Cape market eating into 
optimism we saw rates under further pressure on Panamax 
paper with the curve offered lower through most of the day 
only finding a foothold mid-afternoon. Sept and Oct sold off 
to $12600 and $12900 respectively, Q4 tested but held 
support at $12500 and Cal24 saw less severe downside 
trading $11100 and maintaining good support at $11000. 
We closed supported at the day’s lows with sellers 
seemingly content for the time being as offers all but 
thinned out making for a quiet close.
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