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Following a quiet start to the month, the Cape market saw 
some life today with bid support from the onset. Throughout 
the morning the Cape market gapped up before settling into 
a range. Capes Sept and Oct traded up to $12100 and 
$16000 respectively while the Q4 trades up to $16000. 
Further out the bid support continued with the Cal24 trading 
up to $14000 with the Cal25 finding value between $14350 - 
$14600. Just as the TC's saw a firmer market so too did the 
C5 with Sept trading $8.05 and Q4 finding value around 
$8.55.

Busy opening to the week on Panamax paper with rates 
gapping up in early trading as buyers continued to chase a 
thin offer side as the underlying looks to bottom out with 
sentiment further bolstered by the firmer Cape market and 
optimism around the  rally on Chinese property stocks. 
Sept pushed to $13400 and Oct jumped up to $14000, 
nudging Q4 up to $13400 high. Further out cal24 and 
Cal25 traded in some size adding as the spread widened to 
$500 with Cal24 trading up from $11550 to $11800 and 
Cal25 $11250 to 11300. We closed supported at the days 
highs with the tone more optimistic but all eyes on the 
underlying now for  some follow through.     
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