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A day of two halves with Cape paper opening well offered with Nov 
sold $18250 (-$500) and Dec sold $20750. The market continued 
to slide with Nov sold $18000, $17900 and $17750 and Dec sold 
down to a lot of $20250. Nov vs Dec spreads were very active 
trading in a range of -$2750 to -$2500. Q1 was sold down to 
$14000, Q2 sold at $18700 and Q34 sold at $23350. The Cal25 
slipped below $20000 with the low of print at $19850. The evening 
saw a big turnaround with Nov paid up to $18500, Dec paid up to 
$21000 and Cal25 with big buying flows seeing $20300 paid on 
close. Have a good evening.

It was a largely range bound start on Panamax paper with little 
movement throughout the morning session as rates ticked over at 
the previous nights close. Despite another negative index a turn 
around on Capes mid afternoon and talk of a floor saw some 
short covering triggered. A thin offer side and mounting pressure 
to close out saw rates rallying as the bandwagon effect took over 
and saw Oct and Nov paid up to $10900 while Dec traded up to 
$11250 while further out Q1 traded up to $10200 and Cal25 
traded up to $11650 with buyers looking to improve on this level. 
Towards the close buyers backed off making for a quiet close as 
sellers seemed content to hold off to see what tomorrow might 
bring.
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