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Another very lively day, as the bullish Cape market continued, with 
a range of buyers stepping in from the start. With C5 fixing up to 
$11.20, positive sentiment was strong as June reached $25,250, 
July traded up to $21,000, and August peaked at $18,250. Just 
before the index, Q3 also raced higher, trading at a high of 
$19,500. A positive index reading (+$1,385) further supported the 
market as buying interest continued. However, the afternoon 
session saw liquidity thin out, and rates pulled back slightly from 
their peaks, with Q3 trading at $19,300 and July easing to $20,850 
as we stalled into the close. Overall, a strong week for the Cape 
market both physically and on paper. Have a good weekend! 

The Panamax market continued to enjoy gains to end the week 
as the curve pushed up again. Bid support was evident from the 
start, with several physical buyers stepping in early, pushing June 
and July both up to $10,700. August reached a high of $10,400, 
and Q3 traded up to $10,400. The index came in as expected 
(+$234), which brought a lull in momentum during the afternoon 
session, with good bids gradually picked off. Panamax Q3 traded 
a few times at $10,300 as we approached the close. The back 
end saw some early action, with $9,950 trading on Cal26, though 
there was little activity in the afternoon. We end the day a touch 
above the morning’s opening rates.
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